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EDITORIAL 
 

I feel very proud in congratulating the team 
members of “Brahmavart Research Institute”, 
Kanpur for their endevour in successfully entering 
in Second Year of publication of “Journal de 
Brahmavart”.  

 
The March-June 2016 issue of “Journal de 
Brahmavart”.  The field of archaeology is now not 
limited to deeging of land or the discovery and 
introduction of latest scientific instruments helps 
archaeology. It has become more scientific and 
very near to acuracy.  

 
With the advancement of information technology 
and internet resourses it is fuelling the trend of 
inter-disceplinary researchers in the pure science 
and social sciences as well.  Hope this Journal will 
provide you stage for sharing ideas and help 
encouraging researches. 

 
 I thank all the researchers and contributors of the 
current issue of Journal de Brahmavart for 
spending their vluable time in submission of papers 
well within stipulated time. Papers appeared in this 
issue represents variety of disciplines i.e. 
archaeology, history, education and culture and so 
on.  
 
 Your valuable observations and suggestions will be 
our assest.  
 
 
Dr. Ashok K. Tiwari 
Editor in Chief 
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